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BITDEFENDER BOX PRODUCT 

One Year Limited Hardware Warranty 

Please retain your receipt as proof of purchase. 

THIS WARRANTY GIVES YOU SPECIFIC LEGAL RIGHTS, AND YOU MAY HAVE OTHER RIGHTS THAT VARY FROM STATE TO 
STATE, PROVINCE, OR COUNTRY. OTHER THAN AS PERMITTED BY LAW, BITDEFENDER DOES NOT EXCLUDE, LIMIT OR 
SUSPEND OTHER RIGHTS YOU HAVE. FOR A FULL UNDERSTANDING OF YOUR RIGHTS YOU SHOULD CONSULT THE LAWS 
OF YOUR STATE, PROVINCE, OR COUNTRY. 

BITDEFENDER BOX PRODUCT contained in their original packaging is warranted against defects in materials and workmanship when 
the products are used normally for their intended purposes, for a period of ONE YEAR from the date of the original purchase of the 
product from Bitdefender or a Bitdefender authorized reseller. (“Warranty Period”). If a defect arises during the Warranty Period, in 
Bitdefender sole option, to the extent permitted by law, Bitdefender can any of the following: i) repair the product at no charge using 
new parts or parts that are equivalent to new in performance; ii) exchange the product with a functionally equivalent product that is new 
or equivalent to new in performance, or iii) refund the original purchase price. This warranty excludes damages resulting from abuse, 
accident, modification, or if it has been used or maintained in a manner not conforming to product manual instructions, has been modified 
in any way, or has had any serial number removed or defaced or other causes that are not defects in materials and workmanship. 
Additionally, this warranty does not protect against damage from normal use or wear and tear. Repair or modification of the product by 
anyone other than BITDEFENDER approved providers will void this warranty. This limited warranty is transferable from the original 
purchaser to subsequent owners, however the Warranty Period will not be extended in duration or expanded in any way as a result of 
a transfer of ownership. 

This warranty applies to BITDEFENDER BOX PRODUCT you have purchased from a Bitdefender authorized reseller and only when it 
is accompanied by a receipt or proof of purchase. If you purchase a BITDEFENDER BOX PRODUCT from an unauthorized reseller or 
if the original factory serial number has been removed, defaced or altered, this warranty will not be valid. When you purchase products 
from an unauthorized website or dealer, you are taking a risk because these products may be counterfeit, used, defective, or may not 
be designed for use in your country.  Please visit Bitdefender website to check the authorized resellers list.   

EXCEPT AS EXPRESSLY SET FORTH IN THIS AGREEMENT, AND TO THE MAXIMUM EXTENT PERMITTED BY APPLICABLE 
LAW BITDEFENDER DISCLAIMS ALL OTHER WARRANTIES, EXPRESS OR IMPLIED, CONSEQUENTIAL, INCIDENTAL, 
EXEMPLARY, OR SPECIAL DAMAGES WHETHER ORAL, WRITTEN,  STATUTORY WITH RESPECT TO THE BITDEFENDER 
PRODUCTS, ENHANCEMENTS, MAINTENANCE OR SUPPORT RELATED THERETO, OR ANY OTHER MATERIALS (TANGIBLE 
OR INTANGIBLE) OR SERVICES SUPPLIED BY BITDEFENDER. BITDEFENDER HEREBY EXPRESSLY DISCLAIMS ANY IMPLIED 
WARRANTIES AND CONDITIONS, INCLUDING, WITHOUT LIMITATION, THE IMPLIED WARRANTIES OF MERCHANTABILITY, 
DAMAGES FOR LOSS OF GOODWILL, WORK STOPPAGE, LOSS OF DATA, DEVICE FAILURE OR MALFUNCTION, FITNESS 
FOR A PARTICULAR PURPOSE, COSTS OF REPLACEMENT GOODS OR COSTS OF RECOVERING DATA, OTHER DAMAGES, 
TITLE, NON INTERFERENCE, ACCURACY OF DATA, ACCURACY OF INFORMATIONAL CONTENT, SYSTEM INTEGRATION, 
AND NON INFRINGEMENT OF THIRD PARTY RIGHTS BY FILTERING, DISABLING, OR REMOVING SUCH THIRD PARTY'S 
SOFTWARE, SPYWARE, ADWARE, COOKIES, EMAILS, DOCUMENTS, ADVERTISEMENTS OR THE LIKE, WHETHER ARISING 
BY STATUTE, LAW, COURSE OF DEALING, CUSTOM AND PRACTICE, OR TRADE USAGE. IF IMPLIED WARRANTIES CANNOT 
BE DISCLAIMED, THEN SUCH WARRANTIES ARE LIMITED IN DURATION TO THE DURATION OF THIS WARRANTY. IN 
ADDITION TO THE INFORMATION PROVIDED IN THE ORIGINAL PACKAGING, BITDEFENDER PROVIDES INFORMATION 
REGARDING THE BOX ONLINE. WITHOUT LIMITING THE GENERALITY OF THE DISCLAIMERS PROVIDED ABOVE, ALL 
PRODUCT INFORMATION IS PROVIDED FOR YOUR CONVENIENCE, “AS IS” AND “AS AVAILABLE”.  BITDEFENDER DOES NOT 
REPRESENT, WARRANT OR GUARANTEE THAT THE PRODUCT INFORMATION WILL BE AVAILABLE, ACCURATE OR 
RELIABLE, OR THAT THE PRODUCT WILL INTEGRATE WITH ALL OTHER DEVICES YOU USE ON A NETWORK. 
BITDEFENDER’S TOTAL LIABILITY ARISING FROM THE USE OF BITDEFENDER BOX, OR RELATED TO THIS LIMITED 
WARRANTY, SHALL NOT EXCEED THE AMOUNT ORIGINALLY PAID FOR THE PRODUCT AS EVIDENCED IN THE PROOF OF 
PURCHASE RECEIPT. No other person is authorized to modify this limited warranty, and your seller is solely responsible for any other 
warranties. 

Some jurisdictions do not allow limitations on how long an implied warranty lasts, or allow exclusion or limitation of incidental or 
consequential damages, so the above limitations or exclusions may not apply to you. 

All rights, titles and interest in and to Bitdefender and all industrial design, copyright rights in and to BITDEFENDER BOX PRODUCT, 
the accompanying printed materials, and any copies of Bitdefender are owned by BITDEFENDER, with the understanding that rights, 
titles and interest in and to certain third party software identified in the accompanying Third Party License Terms are owned by their 
respective owners. Bitdefender is protected by patent, copyright laws and international treaty provisions. Therefore, you must treat 
Bitdefender like any other copyrighted material. As used throughout the Bitdefender website, Quick Setup Guide or other marketing and 
product related materials, the term “BOX” refers to Bitdefender BOX trademark with USA serial number '86374731'. 

Warranty conditions. In order submit a valid claim, it has to be accompanied by: i) an RMA number (A package return by customer 
should be accompanied by the packaging slip); ii) the failed product to the address provided returned at your shipping cost; iii) your 
receipt as proof of purchase.  

Contact BITDEFENDER SRL, at 24, Delea Veche Street, Building A , ground floor, Sector 2, Bucharest, Romania, or at Tel No: 40-21-
206.34.70 or Fax: 40-21-264.17.99, e-mail address: office@Bitdefender.com. 

 

 


